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2012 for cloud adoption was Microsoft Azure. Here are
some of the key highlights: 81% of UK cloud adoption is

for Windows Azure 8.6% of the respondents reported
using a service like Amazon Web Services and if asked if

they were using any other services, 32.5% said they
were using Google Apps. Cloud adoption is driven by

accessibility, scalability, speed of deployment and
managed services. Nearly two-thirds of users of cloud-
based applications look to save money on their hosting
bills and over half of all users will have a move to cloud

without notifying their clients. Eighty-one percent of
respondents said they are adopting the cloud for

Windows Azure, which is unsurprising given the relatively
recent launch of Windows Azure. This is likely to be

followed by a move to Amazon Web Services, given the
UK government’s support of the Microsoft-led Open
Government Partnership. Amazon is looking to sell

services like AppStream to providers of software and
services, but the European Commission has deferred the

decision on whether to grant it a preliminary
authorisation (PA) and it could be a while before there is
clarity. CloudCures has written a recent blog post about
the report they commissioned on cloud adoption. The
report, CloudCures: UK Consultancy Cloud Adoption

Survey 2012 (PDF), was carried out by Callum Pengelly
and Nick Dallimore of Big ISS Consulting Ltd and was

commissioned by CloudCures. Here is their write-up of
the report: CloudCures: UK Consultancy Cloud Adoption

Survey 2012 (PDF) CloudCures commissioned a survey of
3,714 consultants to find out what the growth in cloud-
based services has meant to them and their clients. The
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results are presented in the report CloudCures: UK
Consultancy
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